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Obituary
Carol A. Jordan aka Mushie was born April 27, 1962 to Annette
Jordan. She entered into eternal rest onApril 30th, 2021. She attended
P.S. #22, Lincoln High School and Hudson County Community
College Culinary Arts Program and she completed all of her academic
requirements.

Carol has worked in many different fields of employment. She was a
workaholic. She took pride in every job she had. She did not believe in
taking days off. Her employment history included being a home health
aide, a bus attendant for Amity bus service, a lunch aide for P.S. #4, a
teacher assistant at A. Harry Moore Special Education School of
Jersey City and a Jersey City crossing guard. Carl’s work history
spanned over four decades.

She was a member of St. John’s A. M.E. Church until the church
closed and then she joined Mt. Pisgah A.M. E. Church where she
became a faithful member of the nurses’ unit. Carol was blessed by the
spiritual experiences that she received while worshipping God. Her
favorite scripture as Psalm 23.

Carol enjoyed watching reality crime shows, comedy movies and
black & white movies. She also loved music.

Carol’s desire was to travel and she dreamed of working in law
enforcement or to be a lawyer. She loved Lay’s potato chips and Sprite
soda. She drank black tea every morning with a croissant and a
banana. It was made very clear that no one touches her tea.

Carol was preceded in death by her motherAnnette Jordan and her two
brothers Kenneth Jordan and Clarence Wright Jr.

Leaving to cherish Carol’s precious memories are her four sons
Marcus, Michael, Markell and Suton Jordan, two grandsons Mykel
and Ace Jordan. Also surviving are three sisters Gale Olmeda (Juan),
Phyllis Menter (James) and Lisa Wright, three brothers Robert Jordan,
Patrick Wright (Simbell), Dwayne Wright (Angela), a host of nieces
and nephews. One aunt Imogene Thompson of Jersey City and one
uncle Dr. Willie Thompson of Adelphi, Maryland. One great aunt
Irene Jordan from Raleigh, N.C. three god daughters Jayshri, Deatrich
and Shalena. Many cousins and a host of relatives and friends,
including her very special friends Theresa, Granny and Keisha.
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