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Hazel “Chinnie” Hubbard was born on June 30, 1932 to Roscoe and Gladys
Wilson in Newark, NJ.

Chinnie was raised on Lillie Street in Newark, the 3rd of 4 Daughters. She
attended Cleveland Ave. Elementary School, West Kinney Junior High, and
South Side High School. Due to a serious illness as a teen, she was unable to
graduate. Soon after her recovery in 1953, while on a trip to Philadelphia, PA,
she met Sergeant John Hubbard. John, on leave from his station in Wurzburg,
Germany, and headed home to Philly, immediately became smitten with her. So
much so that the next week he made her his wife before returning to Germany
the following week. A few months later, she joined him in Germany and they
began their married life. During their marriage, they welcomed a Daughter
Regina in 1955. After returning from the war, they settled in NJ but separated
some years later.

Through the years, Chinnie continued to thrive and prosper in her church Greater
Harvest Baptist Church. She strived as a single parent with determination,
strength, and much love. She and Regina moved to FDR Homes (now Terrell
Homes) in the Ironbound Section of Newark in 1962. She was an active member
of the Tenant’s Association, and lived in that community for over 40 years.

She worked for many years for the Newark Board of Education. She started her
career there as a Custodian at Hudson St. School and eventually became a Bus
Attendant for the school system working primarily with challenged and disabled
students. “Ms. Hazel” was loved by her co-workers, but especially the students
and parents she serviced during her tenure. She worked for the Board until her
retirement. In addition, she worked for the Essex County Elections Board
manning the Polls for many years at Hawkins Street School in the Ironbound.

She is preceded in Death by her Mom, Gladys (Norris) Wilson, Dad, Roscoe
Wilson, Sisters, Ruby (Norris) Miller and Nadine (Wilson) Moore, niece,
Lavante Thornton.

Chinnie is survived by her Daughter, Regina Hubbard-Johnson (late Danny
Johnson), Granddaughter Roscelle Hubbard, Sister Helen Thornton, Great
Grandchildren Leilani, Amare’, and Zion, Nephews Marcus Thornton and Gore
Moore; and a host of other cherished relatives and friends.
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The family of Hazel Hubbard wishes to express our
sincere thanks for the prayers and other expressions of

love during our time of bereavement.


