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Acknowledgement
The family of the late Jason Scott wishes to
acknowledge with deep appreciation the many

expressions of love, concern and kindness shown to our
family during this our time of bereavement. May God

Bless and Keep You!
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Jason was born January 15, 1969 in Passaic, New Jersey.  He
was the son of the late Geraldine Scott and late Matthew
Lawson. Jason departed this life on Thursday, March 12,
2020.

Jason was educated in Passaic, NJ.  He graduated from Pope
Pius High School, and went on to receive a graduate degree
from Rutgers University. He continued his education, and
received a degree in Library Science at Pratt Institute in NYC.

Jason worked for Integrity Insurance Company until they
closed their doors.  He worked at various positions before he
was called home.  Jason enjoyed the companionship of his
fellow workers, and was outgoing and made friends easily.
He had the gift of gab and a keen sense of humor.

Jason joined Calvary Baptist Church of Garfield and was
baptized at an early age.  He was active in Sunday school and
a regular church member.

Jason is predeceased by his parents Geraldine Scott and
Matthew Lawson.

He leaves to mourn, one uncle; John (Gayla) Scott of Ocala,
FL, six aunts; Jean Cason and Maryann Scott of
Summerfield, FL, Helen Brown of Longwood, FL, Joyce
Scott of Altamonte Springs, FL, Debra Scott of Johnstown,
PA, and Elizabeth Monroe of Lodi, NJ; one step-brother,
Kenny Thorn; a step-mother, Princess Tina Lawson, of
Georgia; his many beloved cousins, and a host of cherished
friends.
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