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Our beloved Renee Cilotte Maurice went home to be with the Lord on November
15, 2019 at 11:41 in the morning. Renee was born on August 25, 1958 in Hinche,
Haiti. Renee was the daughter of Raymond René Augustin and Lunie (Eugene)
Augustin.

Renee immigrated to the United States from Haiti in 1980. She settled in New
Jersey in 1985, where she worked and raised her family. Renee accomplished her
dream of owning a home and purchased her 1st home in 1995. Renee was family
oriented and nothing brought her more joy than raising her children in a suburban
area with a great school district.

She worked for Frigidaire for 13 years before retiring in 2003 and beginning a
new career in the healthcare field as a CNA. As a CNA she showed elderly
individuals care, compassion, companionship, and friendship. She enjoyed
helping others and took pride in caring for others. She retired as a CNA in 2011.

Renee was loving, caring, compassionate, strong willed and loyal person to all
who knew her. She had a beautiful smile that could light up your soul. She loved
the Lord and attended Our Lady of Sorrows Church in South Orange, NJ. She
enjoyed listening to music, gardening, sewing, traveling, and cooking.

The relationship Renee had with her family was one of a kind. She was a kind
and loving soul who was protective of her family and those dear to her heart.
Most of all, Renee loved and adored her children; James, Diana, and Farrah. Her
grandson Ajani was the apple of her eye.

She was preceded in death by her father, Raymond Rene Augustin, her mother,
Lunie (Eugene) Augustin, brothers, Raymond Augustin and Daddie Agustin.

She is survived by her husband: Jean Emmanuel Maurice who she married in
1985; her son, James St. Fort; her daughter, Diana Maurice and her fiancé, Javar
Kemp and her daughter, Farrah Maurice; her brothers, Jean Alix Augustin,
Mozard Andrew Augustin, Edvard Augustin, and Rony Augustin; her sisters,
Mirlande Jones and Gessie Niles; and her grandson, Ajani Kemp. She is also
survived by a host of other relatives and friends.

Professional Services Provided By

www.honoryou.com


